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RUBRIC: SHORT ANSWER

CLAIM/FOCUS

MEETS EXPECTATIONS

APPROACHES
EXPECTATIONS

DOESN'T MEET
EXPECTATIONS

SUPPORT/EVID

MEETS EXPECTATIONS

APPROACHES
EXPECTATIONS

DOESN'T MEET
EXPECTATIONS

ORGANIZATION

MEETS EXPECTATIONS

APPROACHES
EXPECTATIONS

DOESN'T MEET
EXPECTATIONS

LANGUAGE

 

State a clear claim/topic sentence and stay focused on supporting it.

A precise claim/topic sentence based on the topic and/or source(s) is present. The
response maintains a strong focus on developing the claim/topic sentence,
thoroughly addressing the demands of the task.

A claim/topic sentence based on the topic and/or source(s) is present, but it may
not completely address the demands of the task, or the response does not
maintain focus on developing it.

The claim/topic sentence is vague, unclear, or missing, and the response does not
address the demands of the task.

Provide evidence and explain how it supports the claim/topic sentence.

The response includes sufficient, appropriate evidence to support the claim/topic
sentence. Reasoning and understanding of the topic and/or source(s) are
demonstrated by thorough explanations of the relationship between claims and
support.

The response presents some evidence to support the claim/topic sentence, but it
may be insufficient or inappropriate. Some reasoning and understanding of the
topic and/or source(s) are demonstrated, but attempts to explain the relationship
between claims and support are inadequate.

Evidence is general or largely absent, and explanation of the relationship between
claims and support is minimal.

Present ideas in a logical structure that shows the relationships between ideas.

An effective organizational structure enhances the reader's understanding of the
information. The relationships between ideas are made clear with effective
transitional phrases.

An organizational structure is evident, but may not be fully developed or
appropriate. Transitional phrases may be used but the relationships between
ideas are somewhat unclear.

An organizational structure is largely absent and the relationships between ideas
are unclear.

Communicate ideas using formal language and vocabulary specific to the topic.



MEETS EXPECTATIONS

APPROACHES
EXPECTATIONS

DOESN'T MEET
EXPECTATIONS

The response has an established, formal style that is maintained throughout.
Varied sentence structure, precise language, and domain-specific vocabulary are
used to communicate ideas effectively. The response may stray from an objective
tone at times, or have some errors that do not interfere with meaning.

The response attempts a formal style that may not be maintained throughout.
Sentence structure is somewhat varied and some precise language and/or
domain-specific vocabulary are used. The response contains some errors that may
interfere with meaning.

The response does not establish a formal style and and ideas are unclear at times.
There is little variety in sentence structure and language is general throughout.
The response contains several errors that interfere with meaning.


