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To: Dian Sawitri <dian.r.sawitri@gmail.com>

Dear
Dian Sawitri

We would like to inform you that your paper has been accepted to be published in March 2023 volume. You should
pay the APC Fee Rp. 1.500.000. to BNI no 0038413051 a/n Triantoro Safaria.

Thank you
Editor-Chief
On Mon, Mar 13, 2023 at 8:30 AM Dian Sawitri <dian.r.sawitri@gmail.com> wrote:
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