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intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com>

manuscript
9 messages

intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com> Thu, Dec 12, 2019 at 8:18 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro

Dear Editor,
Here I send the manuscript to be published in the Quality Access to Success. Thank you for concerning.

Best regards,
team.

2 attachments

QATS.doc
258K

COVER LETTER.docx
12K

Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> Fri, Dec 13, 2019 at 3:12 PM
Reply-To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
To: intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com>

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

We have now started to schedule, articles already accepted for publication, for the first issue of 2021 (The entire editorial space for 2020 has been covered).

If this term suits you, please let me know and within a month, your article will be evaluated. 

Sincerely,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 3:19 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: manuscript

 

Dear Editor,

Here I send the manuscript to be published in the Quality Access to Success. Thank you for concerning.

 

Best regards,

team.

intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com> Sat, Dec 14, 2019 at 3:54 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro

Thank you for concerning my manuscripts. Hopefully my article will be published soon on your journal.

Best regards,
Team.

On Fri, Dec 13, 2019, 3:11 PM Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> wrote:

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

We have now started to schedule, articles already accepted for publication, for the first issue of 2021 (The entire editorial space for 2020 has been covered).
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If this term suits you, please let me know and within a month, your article will be evaluated. 

Sincerely,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief

Indexed in:

WEB OF SCIENCE - ESCI, SCOPUS,

EBSCO, PROQUEST and

listed in CABELL'S Whitelist

E-mail: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro

Web: www.calitatea.srac.ro

 

From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 3:19 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: manuscript

 

Dear Editor,

Here I send the manuscript to be published in the Quality Access to Success. Thank you for concerning.

 

Best regards,

team.
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Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> Wed, Jan 8, 2020 at 3:35 PM
Reply-To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
To: intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com>

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

Your article has been evaluated and it could be published in the February 2021 issue of Quality-Access to Success Journal (Vol. 22, No. 180). Publication fee is 350 EUR.

To be able to schedule the publication of the article, I am waiting for your answer if you agree the publication date and the publication fee. If the answer is yes, you will
receive the instructions for payment. If no response is received for 15 days, the schedule for publishing of the paper is canceled.

Sincerely,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 3:19 PM
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To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: manuscript

 

Dear Editor,

Here I send the manuscript to be published in the Quality Access to Success. Thank you for concerning.

 

Best regards,

team.

intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com> Wed, Jan 8, 2020 at 5:00 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro

Dear Editor,

Thank you for the good news. I will do payment for publication. Please send me the prosedure. Thank you.

Best regards,
Team

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 3:35 PM Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> wrote:

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

Your article has been evaluated and it could be published in the February 2021 issue of Quality-Access to Success Journal (Vol. 22, No. 180). Publication fee is 350
EUR.

To be able to schedule the publication of the article, I am waiting for your answer if you agree the publication date and the publication fee. If the answer is yes, you will
receive the instructions for payment. If no response is received for 15 days, the schedule for publishing of the paper is canceled.

Sincerely,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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Subject: manuscript

 

Dear Editor,

Here I send the manuscript to be published in the Quality Access to Success. Thank you for concerning.

 

Best regards,

team.
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Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> Wed, Jan 8, 2020 at 5:22 PM
Reply-To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
To: intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com>
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Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

In attachment you can find a proforma invoice (deadline 1st of August 2020) with payment details.

Best regards,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, January 08, 2020 12:01 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: Re: manuscript

 

Dear Editor,

 

Thank you for the good news. I will do payment for publication. Please send me the prosedure. Thank you.
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Best regards,

Team

 

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 3:35 PM Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> wrote:

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

Your article has been evaluated and it could be published in the February 2021 issue of Quality-Access to Success Journal (Vol. 22, No. 180). Publication fee is 350
EUR.

To be able to schedule the publication of the article, I am waiting for your answer if you agree the publication date and the publication fee. If the answer is yes, you will
receive the instructions for payment. If no response is received for 15 days, the schedule for publishing of the paper is canceled.

Sincerely,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 3:19 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: manuscript
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Dear Editor,

Here I send the manuscript to be published in the Quality Access to Success. Thank you for concerning.

 

Best regards,

team.

Proforma350.pdf
110K

intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com> Wed, Jan 8, 2020 at 5:30 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro

Thank you, we will do payment before the dateline (before August 1st 2020). 

Best regards,
Team

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 5:22 PM Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> wrote:

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

In attachment you can find a proforma invoice (deadline 1st of August 2020) with payment details.

Best regards,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, January 08, 2020 12:01 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: Re: manuscript

 

Dear Editor,

 

Thank you for the good news. I will do payment for publication. Please send me the prosedure. Thank you.

 

 

 

Best regards,

Team

 

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 3:35 PM Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> wrote:

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

Your article has been evaluated and it could be published in the February 2021 issue of Quality-Access to Success Journal (Vol. 22, No. 180). Publication fee is 350
EUR.

To be able to schedule the publication of the article, I am waiting for your answer if you agree the publication date and the publication fee. If the answer is yes, you will
receive the instructions for payment. If no response is received for 15 days, the schedule for publishing of the paper is canceled.

Sincerely,
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Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 3:19 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: manuscript

 

Dear Editor,

Here I send the manuscript to be published in the Quality Access to Success. Thank you for concerning.

 

Best regards,

team.

2 attachments
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intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com> Thu, Jan 9, 2020 at 7:59 AM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro

Dear Editor, can I get the Letter of Acceptance (LoA) to inform our institution that the article can be published? Thank you.

Best regards,

Team

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 5:30 PM intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com> wrote:
Thank you, we will do payment before the dateline (before August 1st 2020). 

Best regards,
Team

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 5:22 PM Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> wrote:

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

In attachment you can find a proforma invoice (deadline 1st of August 2020) with payment details.

Best regards,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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Web: www.calitatea.srac.ro

 

From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, January 08, 2020 12:01 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: Re: manuscript

 

Dear Editor,

 

Thank you for the good news. I will do payment for publication. Please send me the prosedure. Thank you.

 

 

 

Best regards,

Team

 

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 3:35 PM Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> wrote:

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

Your article has been evaluated and it could be published in the February 2021 issue of Quality-Access to Success Journal (Vol. 22, No. 180). Publication fee is 350
EUR.

To be able to schedule the publication of the article, I am waiting for your answer if you agree the publication date and the publication fee. If the answer is yes, you
will receive the instructions for payment. If no response is received for 15 days, the schedule for publishing of the paper is canceled.

Sincerely,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 3:19 PM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: manuscript

 

Dear Editor,

Here I send the manuscript to be published in the Quality Access to Success. Thank you for concerning.

 

Best regards,

team.

Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> Thu, Jan 9, 2020 at 2:26 PM
Reply-To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
To: intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com>

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

You can find in attachment the requested document.

Best regards,
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Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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From: intan shaf [mailto:intanshaferi@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 09, 2020 3:00 AM
To: tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro
Subject: Re: manuscript

 

Dear Editor, can I get the Letter of Acceptance (LoA) to inform our institution that the article can be published? Thank you.

 

 

Best regards,

 

Team

 

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 5:30 PM intan shaf <intanshaferi@gmail.com> wrote:
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Thank you, we will do payment before the dateline (before August 1st 2020). 

 

 

Best regards,

Team

 

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 5:22 PM Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac..ro> wrote:

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

In attachment you can find a proforma invoice (deadline 1st of August 2020) with payment details.

Best regards,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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Dear Editor,

 

Thank you for the good news. I will do payment for publication. Please send me the prosedure. Thank you.

 

 

 

Best regards,

Team

 

On Wed, Jan 8, 2020, 3:35 PM Tudor Maruntelu <tudor.maruntelu@srac.ro> wrote:

Dear Prof. Intan Shaferi,

Your article has been evaluated and it could be published in the February 2021 issue of Quality-Access to Success Journal (Vol. 22, No. 180). Publication fee is
350 EUR.

To be able to schedule the publication of the article, I am waiting for your answer if you agree the publication date and the publication fee. If the answer is yes, you
will receive the instructions for payment. If no response is received for 15 days, the schedule for publishing of the paper is canceled.

Sincerely,

 

Tudor-George Maruntelu

Editor-in-Chief
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Dear Editor,

Here I send the manuscript to be published in the Quality Access to Success. Thank you for concerning.

 

Best regards,

team.
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