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Re: the status of the paper "Performance of growth, nutrition value, total carotene, EPA, and
DHA in eel ..."

From: gavriloaie ionel claudiu (ionelclaudiu@yahoo.com)

To: dianachilmawati@yahoo.com

Date: Tuesday, 1 June 2021 at 02:11 am GMT+7

Dear Dr. Diana Chilmawati,

I well received the revised paper. We also received the processing fee.
More soon.
Thank you very much!

Cordially yours,
Claudiu Gavriloaie

On Monday, May 31, 2021, 9:26:30 AM GMT+3, diana chilmawati <dianachilmawati@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Claudiu Gavriloaie, Ph.D
Editor-in-chief AACL Bioflux Journal

Herewith I send the revised article based on existing reviews.
Please, reply to this email to ensure that you receive it well.
Thank you very much. 

Best regards,
Diana Chilmawati
Faculty of Fisheries and Marine Sciences
Diponegoro University
Indonesia

On Friday, 21 May 2021, 4:30:05 am GMT+7, gavriloaie ionel claudiu <ionelclaudiu@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Diana Chilmawati,

I have the pleasure to send you the complete review for your high quality article. We only had
few minor comments. For addressing them, kindly use the attached document only and use a
bright color to highlight the changes you will do.

We also did some editing work.

Concerning the processing fee of 250 USD + bank charges, please pay it by using one of the
two variants below and then send me a scan copy of the transfer document.
I will look forward to your reply.
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Thankfully yours,
Claudiu Gavriloaie, PhD
editor-in-chief AACL Bioflux journal

1st variant of
payment:

Beneficiary: Bioflux
SRL

City: Cluj-Napoca,

Country: Romania,
European Union;

SWIFT CODE of the
bank: BTRLRO22

Account
no. 213USDCRT00L2861401

IBAN:

USD: RO68BTRL01302202L28614XX
(Cluj-Napoca)

EURO: RO19BTRL01304202L28614XX (Cluj-Napoca)

Bank:

BANCA TRANSILVANIA

Important! When
bank transfer is used to pay a publication fee, please pay
attention to
which modality of payment you chose! There are three options: Ben,
Our, Us.

Use always "Us" option (meaning that all the bank transfer
costs are in your concern/ authors
support them and not the publisher). If you
forgot to mention that and you let the bank to set
"Ben" or
"Our" options, we receive about 220 usd instead of 250 usd. Such
payments are not
valid and you need to pay again for the rest of the sum and
one more transfer charge.

 

2nd variant of
payment:

via Paypal. If you
 can process such a payment we can start the online form. For this variant,
 please
contact dr. Petrescu-Mag (zoobiomag2004@yahoo.com).
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Re: the paper "Performance of growth, nutrition value, total carotene, EPA, and DHA in eel
..." is ready for publication

From: gavriloaie ionel claudiu (ionelclaudiu@yahoo.com)

To: dianachilmawati@yahoo.com

Date: Wednesday, 9 June 2021 at 10:17 pm GMT+7

Dear Dr. Diana Chilmawati,

After making the necessary corrections I have uploaded the article on the journal's website:
http://www.bioflux.com.ro/home/volume-14-3-2021/.
Thank you very much for publishing again with us!

With best regards,
Claudiu Gavriloaie

On Wednesday, June 9, 2021, 5:56:33 PM GMT+3, diana chilmawati <dianachilmawati@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Claudiu Gavriloaie, Ph.D

We have done a final check of our article. We found there were a few errors that we needed to
revise. We made a few revisions to 2 things, in the abstract section and the Material and
Method-General information section.
The revision we did was to change "42 days" to "90 days" (in abstract) and add the sub-
sentence “with cultured period of 90 days” (in Material and Method). 
The part that we revised, we give the yellow label. 
Apart from that, everything is correct.
We are sorry for the inconvenience.

Best regards,
Diana Chilmawati

On Wednesday, 9 June 2021, 1:06:33 am GMT+7, gavriloaie ionel claudiu <ionelclaudiu@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Diana Chilmawati,

Kindly check the document attached and then let me know if you agree with the publication in
this form.

The title is already available on the journal's website: http://www.bioflux.com.ro/home/volume-
14-3-2021/.

Thankfully yours,
Claudiu Gavriloaie

http://www.bioflux.com.ro/home/volume-14-3-2021/
http://www.bioflux.com.ro/home/volume-14-3-2021/
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