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1. Bukti Submit dan Revisi Artikel

4/29/25, 8:49 AM Gmail - Revision Required [BaliMedJ] [Manuscript ID: 3220

M G mall Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com>
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Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> Sun, Feb 27, 2022 at 6:45 AM
To: eriawanspu@yahoo.co.id, dswaridiarto@gmail.com, uronanda@gmail.com, sor.urology@gmail.com,
dsw.urobaya@gmail.com, sant44@yahoo.com

Cc: | Gede Putu Supadmanaba <supadmanaba@gmail.com>, | Gede Putu Supadmanaba <sauronichia@gmail.com>, Widya
Anjani <widyaanjani98@gmail.com>

Dear Authors,

Thank you for submitting your article entitled: " VESICO-PERITONEAL FISTULA IN GUILLAIN-
BARRE SYNDROME:

A RARE CAUSE OF PERITONITIS ".

Based on our author guidelines, Your article fulfilled the minimal required structure,
https://www.balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/pages/view/authorguidlines

In order to have a better-structured article, we suggest you edit based on a checklist and the collection in our
archive (https://www.balimedicaljournal.org/index.php/bmj/issue/archive ).

According to the new International regulation, please fulfill the requirements below:
1. Ethical clearance number/statement and/or informed consent at the end of the manuscript (Confirmed).
2. Please state your conflict of interest in the paper. (Confirmed)

3. Please state the funding (if any) in your paper. (Unconfirmed)

4. Please state each author's contribution. (Confirmed)

5. Based on our proofreading application, we detected 103 critical grammatical errors.
6. In affiliation please change into Universitas Diponegoro

7. Please change the abstract into several sections: introduction-case-conclusion

8. In the introduction please explain the mechanism of urinary retention briefly

9. Please explain the aims of this case report at the end of the introduction

10. Please sign the pathology in the figure radiology finding. (e.g arrow, circle, etc)
11. The sentence below is suitable to be explained in the introduction

Guillain-Barré syndrome (GBS) is an autoimmune acute inflammatory polyradicul pathy. The incid ranges around 0.62-
2.66 cases/100,000 person-years across age groups and increases by 20% per 10-year as increased age. The relative risk for male is
1.78. GBS can have multiple clinical findings related to polyradiculoneuropathy. ..

12. In the discussion section please compare with your case report first, before treatment explanation
13. In the discussion section please explain the conclusion briefly, without the definition of GBS.

s

14. Please put the citation after the dot sign “.

According to our reviewers, your article needs moderate revision. Attached is the commentary file from our
reviewers. Please read it carefully and revise your manusetipt accordingly.

Please revise your article and send it back to us in 7 days

In addition, I do need to remind you that Bali Medical Journal is free to submit an Open Access for our
readers. However, if your manuscript is accepted for publication, as the author, you will be charged 1,000
USD for APC. Your article will also be subjected to proofreading and editing (Formatting, Lay outing, and
Galey) which costs 100 USD.
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For revising your article, we offer you editing and revising assistance which is provided by our official
editing partner REVISE and according to your revision status, it will cost 100 USD. Please confirm if you
agree with this information.

Thank you for trusting us with your hard work and we are looking forward to your response.
Warm regards,

Executive Editor BaliMedJ
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2. Bukti Pengiriman Revisi Artikel 1

Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com> Fri, Mar 4, 2022 at 6:18 PM

To: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>

Dear editors,
We have revised our manuscript. We do hope for your consideration in publication. Thank you

[Quoted text hidden]

@ VESICO-PERITONEAL FISTULA IN GUILLAIN-BARRE SYNDROM-Revised.docx
325K

Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com> Fri, Mar 4, 2022 at 6:32 PM

To: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>

Dear editors,
We have revised our manuscript. We do hope for your consideration in publication. Thank you

On Sun, Feb 27, 2022, 06:46 Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

) VESICO-PERITONEAL FISTULA IN GUILLAIN-BARRE SYNDROM-Revised.docx
325K

3. Bukti Revisi Diterima Editor

Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> Sun, Apr 3, 2022 at 7:11 PM
To: Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com>

Dear author
Thank you for your revision, we will adjust the comment with your recent manuscript
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Thank you for trusting us
Best regards

Executive Bami MedJ
[Quoted text hidden]



4. Bukti Artikel Diterima utk Publish

Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> Sun, Apr 24, 2022 at 10:51 AM
To: Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com>

Dear Authors

After considering the suggestion from reviewers and also the quality of your revision we decided to accept your
manuscript for publication. We are sorry for the lengthy process but the editing team has to meet the review points
provided by your reviewers. Meanwhile, your manuscript still needs several revisions according to our checklist
(commentary file attached below). Your manuscript plagiarism score is 45% (file attached below). There are some words
that are plagiarized, please correct it.

Attached below is the invoice for your artide and please use the rate from your bank when you want to pay in IDR. Also
please send us the proof of your payment through this email, so we can process your article for publication. Your LoA will
send as soon as we confirm your payment.

Congratulations on the acceptance of your article. We are looking for your future publication
[Quated text hidden]
4 attachments
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326K

-:I commentary file_CASE REPORT VESICO PERITONEAL FISTULA.pdf
= 147K

-ZI turnitin results_Vesico-peritoneal fistula.pdf
= 40K

.—:I invoice-BMJ-3220.pdf
= 84K

5. Bukti komunikasi dengan editor tentang payment
Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com=> Wed, Apr 27, 2022 at 6:50 PM

To: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>

| will look after it saon
Regarding the payment, is it 1000 USD or 100 USD? Just to make it clear
[Quoted text hidden]

6. Bukti komunikasi dengan editor tentang payment
Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> Thu, Apr 28, 2022 at 5:34 AM
To: Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com>
Dear author
Apologize us for the miscalculation of your invoice
It should be 1000 USD
Here we attached the corrected invoice
Thank you for informing us

Best Regards

Editor BaliMedJ
[Quoted text hidden]
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7.

8.

Bukti pengiriman revisi dan payment

Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com>
To: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>

Good evening, regarding the last revision from editor
| hereby sending the revised version and payment proof within this email

Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]
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(i) VESICO-PERITONEAL FISTULA IN GUILLAIN-BARRE SYNDROM-Revised.docx
393K

Bukti editor akan recheck revisi

Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
To: Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com>

Dear author

Tue, May 3, 2022 at 7:32 PM

Sun, May 8, 2022 at 7:30 AM

Thank you for the confirmation of your payment, we will recheck your revisioin and process it further

Thank you for trusting us

Best regard

Editor of Bali Medical Journal
[Quoted text hidden]

9.

Bukti pengiriman LoA

Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>
To: Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com>

Dear author,
Here we send the LoA of your manuscript (file attached below)

Thank you for trusting us

Best regards

Editor BaliMedJ
[Quoted text hidden]
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10. Bukti komunikasi dengan editor

Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com> Thu, Jun 9, 2022 at 11:48 AM
To: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>

Greetings, i apologize for repeating email. When will it be published?
Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]

11. Bukti laporan plagiarisme dan final edit

Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> Wed, Jun 15, 2022 at 5:18 AM
To: Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com>

Dear Author

Your manuscript is already appropriate with the last commentary file that has been sent. Meanwhile, your manuscript was
a 31% plagiarism report. Meanwhile, our editor fixed it, until the plagiarism report was 23%. There were also several
revisions suggested by our reviewer that have been edited by the editor. Thus, here we attached the final edit for your
manuscript and the plagiarism report file.

We gladly said that the manuscript was appropriate for publication. We attached the final manuscript file and final
commentary answer from the reviewer. We hope you check again your final manuscript before we continue the galley
approval process. Please let us know If you agree to publish your final manuscript. If you have any fixation, please send
the manuscript back to us immediately.

Thank you for your cooperation and for trusting us with your hard work
https://mail.google.com/mailiu/0/7ik=03215ec824&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f. 172587132055 157 16918simpl=msg-f:17258713205515716...  5/6
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Editor

Bali MedJ
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12. Bukti persetujuan proses artikel untuk publish

Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com> Thu, Jun 16, 2022 at 12:08 PM
To: Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com>

Good afternoon, we're gladly agreed to proceed with this manuscript.
Thank you for the support
[Quoted text hidden]

13. Bukti proses publish
Editor Bali Medical Journal <editorbalimedicaljournal@gmail.com> Thu, Jun 23, 2022 at 4:56 AM
To: Dimas Waridiarto <dswaridiarto@gmail.com>
Dear author

Thank you for the information, we are processing your article for the galley step for published
We will inform you if the journal has been published

Thank you for trusting us. We will wait for your other publication
Best regards
Editor BaliMedJ

[Quoted text hidden)



